Agenda Item Number

Meeting Type: Regular Meeting Date: 2/13/2014
Action Requested By: Agenda Item Type
Finance Resolution

Subject Matter:

Approval of Agreement

Exact Wording for the Agenda:

Resolution authorizing the Mayor to enter into a joint purchasing agreement the Madison County
Commission for the joint purchase of Crushed Stone.

Mote: If amendment, please state title and number of the originail

Item to be considered for: Action Unanimous Consent Required: No

Briefly state why the action is required; why it is recommended; what Council action will
provide, allow

and accomplish and; any other information that might be helpful.
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ROUTING SLIP

CONTRACTS AND AGREEMENTS

Originating Department: Finance ~ Council Meeting Date: 2/13/2014
Department Contact: Cecilia Summers  Phone # 427-5060

Contract or Agreement: ',Jyoint\ Pkurc,hasking Agreement with Madisgy)';lkiﬁd‘hnty Ckko“n“xmissionw o
Document Name: 20140213PROBID

City Obligation Amount:
Total Projéd'Budget:
Uncommitted Account Balance: -
Account Number ”
Procurement Agreements

Title 41 | Competitive
Grant-Funded Agreements

Not Applicable Grant Name:
Department Signature Date
1) Originating . S5 C 7 /z.{ / [ <f
2) Legal . 2. - /)/
\ NG A
3) Finance T2/ 1 2 /Lf ///7/
j 7 7 ?

4) Originating /

a. Mayor's office
(1 copies)
b. Clerk-Treasurer
(Original & 2 copies)

Revised 04/15/2011



RESOLUTION NO. 14-

WHEREAS, Code of Alabama, 41-16 - 50 (b), provides as follows:

“(b) The governing bodies of two or more contracting
agencies, as hereinabove enumerated within the same county or
adjoining counties, may provide by Jjoint agreement for the
purchase of labor, services or work, or for the purchase or
lease of materials, equipment, supplies or other personal
property for use by their respective agencies. Such agreement
shall be entered into by similar ordinances, in the case of
municipalities, or resolutions, in the case of other
contracting agencies, adopted by each of the participating
governing bodies, which shall set for the categories of
labor, services or work, or for the purchase or lease of
materials, equipment, supplies or other personal property to
be purchased, the manner of advertising for bids and other
matters deemed necessary to carry out the purpocse of the
agreement. Each contracting agency’s share of expenditures
for purchases under any such agreement shall be appropriated
and paid in the manner set forth in the agreement and in the
same manner as for other expenses of the contracting agency.
The contracting agencies entering into a joint agreement, as
herein permitted, may designate a joint purchasing agent, and
such agent shall have the responsibility to comply with the
provisions of this article. It is provided further that
purchases, contracts or agreements made pursuant to a joint
purchasing agreement shall be subject to all of the terms and
conditions of this article”; and

WHEREAS, the governing bodies of Madison County, Alabama, and the
City of Huntsville, being within the same county, pursuant to the
provision of 41-16-50, desire to provide by joint agreement for
the purchase of materials, to-wit: crushed stone and aggregate
base requirements for a period of one year.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of
Huntsville, as the governing body of Huntsville, Alabama, as
follows:

1. The City of Huntsville does hereby agree with Madison County
for the Jjoint purchase of materials, to-wit: crushed stone
and aggregate base requirements for a period of one year,
pursuant to those certain responses by Vulcan Materials
Company, Madison Materials Inc. and Rogers Group Inc. to the
Madison County Commission Invitation for Bid No.2014-01,
which are substantially in words and figures similar to those
certain documents attached hereto and identified as "Madison
County Commission Invitation For Bids, Bid No.2014-01",
consisting of Twenty-Three (23), Eleven (11) and Twenty-Five
(25) pages respectively with the date of February 13, 2014,
appearing on the margin of the first page, together with the
signature of the City Council President and an executed copy
of said document being permanently kept on file in the Office
of the City Clerk-Treasurer of the City of Huntsville,
Alabama.




RESOLUTION
{(continued)
Page 2 of 2

2.

NO. 14-

————

Bids for the said materials shall be advertised for by the
Madison County Commission in accordance with the provisions
of the Alabama Competitive Bid Law, Title 41-16-50, et seq.

The contract for the purchase of the said materials shall be
awarded by Madison County Commission.

The City of Huntsville and the Madison County Commission
shall separately order the said materials subject to the bid
directly from the lowest responsible bidder to whom the
contract is awarded and each shall pay, pursuant to the terms
of the contract, directly to the lowest responsible bidder to
whom the contract is awarded.

For the purpose of this contract, Angela Anderson, the
Director of Purchasing for Madison County, Alabama is hereby
designated as the joint purchasing agent who shall have the
responsibility to comply with the provisions of the Alabama
Competitive Bid Law, Code of Alabama, Section 41-16-50, et

seq.

All purchases, contracts and agreements made pursuant to this
joint purchasing agreement shall be subject to all of the
terms and conditions of the Alabama Competitive Bid Law, Code
of Alabama, Section 41-16-50.

ADOPTED this the 13th day of February, 2014

President of the City Council
Huntsville, Alabama

APPROVED this the 13th day of February, 2014

Mayor of the City of Huntsville, Alabama



ORGANIZED DEC 13 "A08

COUNTNAS

OFFICE OF
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

Phone: (256) 532-3507
Fax: (256) 532-3677
Emait: purchdpt@co.madison_al.us

January 15, 2014

Madison Materials, Inc. Roger’s Group Vulcan Construction Materials
Attn: David Reed Attn: Dale Cathey Attn: Michael D. Kirkland
692 Convict Camp Road 9271 US Highway 31 4210 Stringfield Road
Guntersville, AL 35976 Tanner. AL 33671 Huntsville. AL 35810

RE: Bid #2014-01
Dear Vendors:

At a regular meeting of the Madison County Commission held on January 15, 2014, the Madison
County Commission accepted your low bid meeting specifications for crushed stone and
aggregate base for a period of one (1) year with the condition that Madison County and the
successful vendor may mutually option to extend the bid award for two (2) additional and
consecutive one (1) year periods. The items your company were awarded are attached and
highlighted in yellow.

We appreciate your response to our bidding process and look forward to hearing from you in the
future.

If you have any questions regarding this bid, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

4
-/
LA e W P s e

3

Angela Anderson, Director
Purchasing Department



Crushed Stone and Aggregate Base

Bid #2014-01
Madison Materials Vulcan Construction Hoover n“na.n o.dcm
Mﬂou‘orwnzn._o: Price Per Ton Picked-up || Price Per Ton Picked-up || Price Per ﬂo:wmma_zu Pnce Per Ton Picked-up
al Plant at Plant al Plant at Plant

Surge Pile $9.00 $ 10.00 $10 85 $10 75|
Dense Graded Base $ 9.00 $10.65 $0 70
1 %" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $ 8.75 $10 65 $6 45
¥" Block Material NB no bid $12 00
%" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $ 8.75 $1065 $0 45

[Alabama Highway Department Number [Price Per 1on Picked.up || Price Per Ton Picked-up || Price Per Ton Ficked.up

al Plant al Plant at Plant at Plant

AHD #5 $8.25 $ 10.30 |no bid $10.75
AHD #57 $8.50 $ 10.30 $11.70) $10.75
AHD #78 $6.00 $ 10.30 $12.20 $10.75]
AHD #7/78 $0.00 $ 10.30 Jno bid $10.75
AHD #810 $8 50 $ 8.756 $10 65 §$9 45
AHD #2 $8.00 S 10.30 $10 85 $1075
AHD #6 N/B N/B no bid $13.00
AHD #67 $8.75 S 10.30 $11.70 $10.75
AHD #8 N/B N/B no bid $14.00
AHD #89 $9.75 $ 12 50 Ino bid $13.40)
AHD, Class 1 Rip-rap $10.50 3 12.00 Jno bid $12.85
AHD, Class 2 Ri $ 12.00

Tabulated By:

Reviewed By: x.x_ it

iy

Date:

Crushed Stone and Aggregate Base
Bid #2014-01



Crushed Stone and Aggregate Base
Bid #2014 01

Madlson Materials Vulean Construction Materiats Hoover Roger's Group, Inc
Price par ton dalivered from plant in Price per ton delivered from plant in Prica per ton delivered from plant in Price per ton detivered from plant in increments of §
ingr [ & inlles u s lierems iles u 28 mi ncre f & milew up to 28 mijes wp ta 28 miles
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Crushed Stone and Aggregste Hase
8id #2014.01



Crushed Stone and Aggregate Base
Bid #2014-01

~ lCost Per Ton Delivered

Descnptlon District 1 |District 1 East] District 3 |District 3 East] District 4 M
Guntersville, AL / 12 months Shed Shed Shed Shed Shed -
Surge Pile $16.55 $15.10 $12.50 $14.60 $16.20] d
Dense Graded Base $15.55 $14.10 $11.50] $1360 $1520] i
1 %" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $15.05 $13.60 $11. $13.10 $14 ?Ol s
% Block Material $15. $14.1 $11 gl $13.60 $1520] o
%" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $15.05 $13.60 $11. $13.10 $1470] n
AHD #5 $15.80 s14.3§F 511% $13.85 $15.45
AHD #57 $16.05 $14.60] $12.00] $14 10 $15.70] m
AHD #78 $16.55 $15.10] $12.50| $14.60 $16.20] ,
AHD #7/78 $16.55 $1510]  $12.50| $14 60| $16.20]
AHD #810 $16.05 $1460]  $12.00] $14.10 $15.70] .
AHD #2 $15.55 s14£)r_ $1160]  $13. $1520| ,
AHD #6 N/B N/B N/B _FUB N/B i
AHD #67 $16.30 $14 85 $12.25 $14.35 $15.95]
AHD #8 N/B N/B 94% N/B N/B i
AHD #89 $17.30 $15. 313.25 $15. $16.95]
AHD, Class 1 Rip-rap $19 05 $17 60} $15.00] $17.10] $18.70
$19.05 $17.60} $15.00] $17.10] $18.70
- |ICost Per Ton Delivered
District 1 |District 1 East] District 3 |District 3 East] District 4 u
Huntsville, AL / 12 months Shed Shed Shed Shed Shed |
Surge Pile $13. $14 85 $15.60 $13. $13.00] ¢
Dense Graded Base $12. $13.85 $14 60| $12.50 $12.00] a
1 %" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run 512.:3 $13.60 $14.35 $12.25 $1165| n
%" Block Material N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B
%" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run 312.% $13.60 $14 .35 S12.2;| $11.75) C
AHD #5 $13.7 $15.15 $15.90) S13.80| S‘l3.30| o
AHD #57 513.7?] $15.15 $15.90 $13.80| $13.30]
AHD #78 $13.70]  $1515]  51590]  $1380]  $13.30]
AHD #7/78 $13.70] $15.15 $15.90) 3130% $13.30]
AHD #810 $12.15 $13.60 $14 35 $12.2 $11.75] ,
AHD #2 S13.ﬂ $15.15 $15.90] $13.80] $13.30] ,
AHD #6 N/B ‘EJNJB N/B N/B N/B c
AHD #67 $13.7 $15.15 $1590 $13. $13.30 t
AHD #8 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B ;
AHD #89 $15. $17.35 $18 10 $16.00] $15. o
AHD, Class 1 Rip-rap $15.40] $16.85 $1760]  $1550]  $15.00f
AHD, Class 2 Rip-rap $16.40] $17.85 $18.60 $16.50} $16.00]

Crushed Stone and Aggregate Base

Bid #2014-01



Crushed Stone and Aggregate Base
Bid #2014-01

|Cost Per Ton Delivered
District 1 |District 1 East] District 3 District 3 District 4
Huntsville, AL / 24 months Shed Shed Shed East Shed Shed

Surge Pile $16.45 $16 .45 $1876 $16.68 $14.71
Dense Graded Base $16.15 $16.15 $18.46 $16.38 $14 41
1 %" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $16.15 $16.15 $18.46 $16.38 $14.41
¥ Block Material No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
%" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $16 15 $16 15 $18 46 $16.38 $14 .41
AHD #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AHD #57 $17.20 $17.20 $19.51 $17.43 $15.46
AHD #78 $17.70 $17.70} $20 01 $17 .93 $15.96
AHD #7/78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AHD #810 $16.15 $16.15 $18.46 $16.38 $14.41
AHD #2 $16.45 $16.45 $18.76 $16.68 $14.71
AHD #6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AHD #67 $17.20 $17.201 $19.51 $17.43 $15.46
AHD #8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AHD #89 No Bid No Bid Nc Bid No Bid No Bid
AHD, Class 1 Rip-rap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AHD, Class 2 Rip-rap $20.03 $20.03 $23.27 $20.96 $1865
[ T B | Cost Per Ton Delivered

District 1 |District 1 East] District 3 District 3 District 4

Tanner, AL / 12 months Shed Shed Shed East Shed Shed

Surge Pile $14.75 $14.75 $14.75 $1475 $14.75
Dense Graded Base $13.70] _ $13.70 $13.70 $13.70 $13 70)
1% Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $1345|  $1345] 1345  $1345|  $1345
%" Block Material $16.00] $16.00 $16.00] $16.00 $16.00}
%" Crush Stone Base/Crusher Run $13.45 $134 $1345 $1345 $13.45
AHD #5 $14.75 $14.75 $14.75 $14.75 $14 75
AHD #57 $1475 $1475 $14.75 $1475 $14.75
AHD #78 $1475]  S1478|  s1a75|  S1475|  $1475
AHD #7/78 $14.75 $14.75) $14.75 $14.75 $14.75
AHD #810 $13.45 $13.45 $13.45 $1345 $1345
AHD #2 $1475 $14.75 $14.75 $14.75 $14.75
AHD #6 $17. $17. “$17. $17. $17.
AHD #67 $14.75 $14.7 $14.75 $14.75 51475
AHD #8 $18. $18.00] $18. $18. $18.
AHD #89 $17.40] $17.40 $17 40| $17.40] $17.40
AHD, Class 1 Rip-rap $16.85 $16. $16.85 $16.85 $16 85
AHD, Class 2 Rip-rap $16.85 $16.8 $16.85 $16 .85 $16 85
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Crushed Stone and Aggregate Base

Bid #2014-01



